
How to come to the conference 
and general information: 

 
By plane from the Belgrade airport  

There will be three transfers from the Airport to hotel on June 19th and June 24th. One in the morning, one 
early afternoon, and one late afternoon.  Exact time will be determined to minimize waiting time. Therefore, 
please send us your flight numbers, arrival and departure time.  

By plane from the Budapest airport 

There is a chance that you can find much easier (and also cheaper) flight to the Budapest. By public 
transportation you can easily arrive to the East railroad station  (Keleti pályaudvar). You can use this link 
http://futar.bkk.hu/?fromCoord=47.432768%2C19.261259&fromName=Liszt%20Ferenc%20Airport%202&to
Coord=47.500231%2C19.082832&toName=Keleti%20p%C3%A1lyaudvar&arriveBy=false&map=13/47.4665
1/19.13943&layers=SVB 

By train from Budapest East railroad station (Keleti pályaudvar).  

There are 3 direct trains from Budapest to Novi Sad (8:05 (arrives 14:55), 12:05 (arrives 18:40) and 22:25 
(arrives 4:48)). You can buy tickets online  

http://elvira.mav-start.hu/elvira.dll/uf?language=2&i=Budapest&e=Novi+Sad&d=2016.06.19&mikor=-
1&u=1&go= 

By train from Vienna 

There is one direct train from Vienna (8:42) via Budapest (12:05) to Novi Sad (18:40).  

By train from direction of Zagreb 

There is no direct train to Novi Sad, but you do not need to go all up to Belgrade. Step-down at Ruma. Next to 
the railway station is bus station. Take bus to Novi Sad. Price is around 300 dinars (less than 3 euros), and you 
have to pay in dinars. Most of the buses stops at Iriški venac, and after that you have to walk 4km. If you are 
arriving on Sunday afternoon, one of the organizers will already be at the hotel by car, so he can pick you up. 
Otherwise, you can go by bus up to the Novi Sad. Bus station is next to the railway station.  

In front of Ruma railway station there are always several TAXI drivers which drives to Novi Sad. You can use 
them, and probably you can ask them to drive you directly to hotel (especially if you are arriving in group). 

By bus from Budapest or Vienna.  

Please check this link: http://en.fudeks.rs/portfolio/budapest/  

Also there are several mini-bus lines from Vienna.  



From Novi Sad railway (and bus) station to the Faculty of Sciences, Department of Mathematics and 
Informatics   

You may take bus number 4, and after that by foot around 500m. Step-up station is just in front of the railway 
station, and  step-down station, named "University campus" is when the bus turns to the right for the third time 
(check the map). 

https://www.google.com/maps/d/edit?mid=z9d56nWVGjjo.kjtSsP3G-hfM 

You can buy bus ticket in the bus and it costs 55 dinars (less than 50 euro-cents), but you will need dinars for 
that. There is an exchange office at  the building in front of the station (about 200m away).   

Also you may take TAXI from the TAXI station located next to the old steam-engine (to the left when you exit 
railway station building). Expected price should be less than 4 euros, and, and if you ask in advance, you can 
probably pay in euros (and expect change in dinars). 

At the Faculty will be organized a place where you can leave luggage and comfortably wait for the transfer to 
hotel.  

From the Faculty building to the hotel Norcev: 

Transfer will be organized on June 19th (probably around 6 PM) and for the way back on June 24th around 
9AM.  Just be sure to send us expected arrival and departure time. 

If there are several participants arriving by the same train from Budapest (Vienna), which comes to Novi Sad at 
18:40, we can organize transfer to hotel directly from the railway station. Also, since this direct train to Vienna 
leaves Novi Sad at 9AM, this group can leave hotel around 8AM, and will be transferred directly to the railway 
station. 

Currency: 

Currently 1 euro =123 dinars.  

Visas 

Please check if you need a visa for entering Serbia.  

http://www.mfa.gov.rs/en/consular-affairs/entry-serbia/visa-regime 

There is a long list of countries whose citizens can enter the country for a short stay (up to 90 days) without 
visas – this includes, for example, all EU and Schengen Area members, USA, Canada, Australia, New Zealand, 
Russia, Ukraine, Israel, Turkey,… Citizens of EU Schengen Area members can also enter Serbia by using their 
ID. 

 

 

 


